
Hard Labor My Adventures In LA - From
Sweating to Succeeding
The City of Angels, a place where dreams are made or broken, a place
where hard work and determination can lead to unimaginable success. Los
Angeles, or simply LA, has always been synonymous with the
entertainment industry - a place where aspiring actors, musicians, and
artists flock to in pursuit of their dreams. However, behind the glamour and
glitz lies a harsh reality. For those who dare to chase their dreams in LA,
hard labor becomes a significant part of their journey.

The Pursuit of Dreams

As I stepped foot onto the streets of LA, a surge of excitement and
nervousness filled my being. I was ready to embark on my own adventure,
pursuing my dreams of becoming a filmmaker. Little did I know that this
journey would entail much more than just creativity and talent.

My first gig in LA involved working as a production assistant on a low-
budget independent film. This meant long hours, physical labor, and a
continuous battle against exhaustion and sleep deprivation. From setting
up lights and carrying heavy equipment to running errands and making
countless cups of coffee, my days were filled with demanding tasks that
pushed me to my limits.
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Concrete Jungle Survival

The concrete jungle of LA can be unforgiving, especially for those with
limited financial resources. In order to sustain myself while chasing my
dreams, I had to take on additional jobs to make ends meet. This led me to
the world of hospitality, where I worked as a server in a bustling downtown
restaurant.

The hard labor continued as I faced demanding customers, worked long
shifts on my feet, and constantly dealt with the pressure of providing
excellent service. But amidst the hustle and bustle, I learned valuable
lessons about perseverance, multitasking, and the importance of
maintaining a positive attitude even in the face of challenging situations.

From Labor to Success

Despite the hardships and physical toll of hard labor, the experience helped
shape me into a stronger individual. The laborious tasks I undertook taught
me humility, patience, and the value of hard work. They also opened doors
and provided opportunities for networking and connections within the
industry.
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As I continued to push forward, my hard work and dedication began to pay
off. I started getting noticed in the film industry, and my persistent efforts led
to opportunities to work on bigger projects. Slowly but surely, I began to
see the fruits of my labor as my dreams turned into reality.

Lessons Beyond the Labor

Through my adventures in LA, I learned that success is not handed to you
on a silver platter. It requires relentless commitment, perseverance, and
often a significant amount of hard labor. While the glamorous façade of LA
may be enticing, the real test lies in the willingness to put in the work.

Over time, I discovered that hard labor encompasses more than just
physical exertion. It extends to the mental and emotional aspects of life,
where one must face rejection, setbacks, and moments of self-doubt.
However, it is through these challenging moments that true growth and
success are achieved.

A Journey Worth Taking

Looking back on my adventures, I wouldn't trade the hard labor and
sacrifices for anything. LA tested me in ways I never thought possible, but it
also allowed me to uncover my true potential and reach new heights.

So, if you're considering chasing your dreams in the city of dreams, be
prepared for the hard labor that awaits you. Embrace it as an essential part
of your journey, knowing that every obstacle serves as a stepping stone
towards achieving your goals.

Remember, it's not just about the destination; it's about the lessons
learned, the growth experienced, and the relentless pursuit of your true



passions.

Join me on this adventure - the adventure of hard labor in the city that
never sleeps, where dreams do come true - Los Angeles!
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Patrick L. Deu Pree has been many things in his life. A bodybuilder, martial
artist, author, film maker and even a grave digger. In the summer of 1978
he left Marin County in Northern California for a new life in the Los Angeles
area. That summer he would go down to the labor lines to work
construction labor. This is the story of that summer.
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